

# BUCKS COUNTY FREE LIBRARY

ESTABLISHED 1956

Headquarters & District Center  
150 South Pine Street, Doylestown, PA 18901  
Phone: 215.348.0332 Fax: 215.348.4760

Martina Kominiarek, CEO

**Bid Pricing:**

These prices are the charges to be billed to the Library. No additional fees, surcharges, costs or expenses will be billed or paid by BCFL. Invoicing shall include the dates of actual service.

Charles J Salvatore  
3036 Haring rd  
Pottsville PA 19070

*EMERALD GARDEN*

MONTHLY LANDSCAPING BID SUBMISSION WORKSHEET

LOCATION	Landscaping Maintenance	Garden Maintenance	Total
BENSALEM	\$ <del>_____</del>	NA	\$ <del>_____</del>
DOYLESTOWN	\$ <del>18,000</del> 11,000	Front Garden, Courtyard and Back Yard \$ 7900	\$ 18900
LANGHORNE	Include two meadow cuts \$ <del>_____</del>	Courtyard \$ <del>_____</del>	\$ <del>_____</del>
LEVITTOWN	\$ <del>_____</del>	Front Garden \$ <del>_____</del>	\$ <del>_____</del>
PERKASIE	\$ 3000.	Side Garden \$ 1200.	\$ 4200.
QUAKERTOWN	\$ 9800.	NA	\$ 9800.
YARDLEY	\$ <del>_____</del>	NA	\$ <del>_____</del>

**Bensalem**  
3700 Hulmeville Road  
Bensalem, PA 19020  
215.638.2031

**Doylestown**  
150 South Pine Street  
Doylestown, PA 18901  
215.348.9081

**Langhorne**  
301 South Pine Street  
Route 413  
Langhorne, PA 19047  
215.757.2510

**Levittown**  
7311 New Falls Road  
Govt. Services Complex  
Levittown, PA 19055  
215.949.2324

**Perkasie**  
491 Arthur Avenue  
Perkasie, PA 18944  
215.257.9718

**Quakertown**  
401 West Mill Street  
Quakertown, PA 18951  
215.536.3306

**Yardley-Makefield**  
1080 Edgewood Road  
Yardley, PA 19067  
215.493.9020

*Emerald Garden*

SNOW REMOVAL BID SUBMISSION WORKSHEET

SNOW REMOVAL BID

LOCATION	2-6 inches	6-12 inches	12+ inches	Ice Treatment
BENSALEM	\$	\$	\$	\$
DOYLESTOWN	\$	\$	\$	\$
LANGHORNE	\$	\$	\$	\$
LEVITTOWN	\$	\$	\$	\$
PERKASIE	\$ 185	\$ 388	\$ 775	\$ 150
QUAKERTOWN	\$ 430	\$ 735	\$ 1250	\$ 280
YARDLEY	\$	\$	\$	\$

# BUCKS COUNTY FREE LIBRARY

ESTABLISHED 1956

Headquarters & District Center  
150 South Pine Street, Doylestown, PA 18901  
Phone: 215.348.0332 Fax: 215.348.4760

Martina Kominiarek, CEO

**Bid Pricing:**

These prices are the charges to be billed to the Library. No additional fees, surcharges, costs or expenses will be billed or paid by BCFL. Invoicing shall include the dates of actual service.

W. D. B.

## MONTHLY LANDSCAPING BID SUBMISSION WORKSHEET

LOCATION	Landscaping Maintenance	Garden Maintenance	Total
BENSALEM	\$ 5900.00	NA	\$ 5900.00
DOYLESTOWN	\$ N/A	Front Garden, Courtyard and Back Yard	\$ N/A
LANGHORNE	Include two meadow cuts \$ 9290.00	Courtyard \$ 2010.00	\$ 11,360.00
LEVITTOWN	\$ 2570.00	Front Garden 1890.00	\$ 4460.00
PERKASIE	\$ N/A	Side Garden \$	\$ N/A
QUAKERTOWN	\$ N/A	NA	\$ N/A
YARDLEY	\$ 6760.00	NA	\$ 6760.00

**Bensalem**  
3700 Hulmeville Road  
Bensalem, PA 19020  
215.638.2031

**Doylestown**  
150 South Pine Street  
Doylestown, PA 18901  
215.348.9081

**Langhorne**  
301 South Pine Street  
Route 413  
Langhorne, PA 19047  
215.757.2510

**Levittown**  
7211 Newlin Avenue  
Govt. Services Complex  
Levittown, PA 19057  
215.949.2324

**Perkasie**  
902 Walnut Avenue  
Perkasie, PA 18944  
215.252.9216

**Quakertown**  
411 West Main Street  
Quakertown, PA 18951  
215.536.3306

**Yardley-Maxfield**  
401 West Main Street  
Yardley, PA 19087  
715.493.9028

	A	B	C	D	E
1					
2					
3					
4	Location	2-6 Inches	6-12 Inches	12+ Inches	Ice Treatment
5					
6	Bensalem	\$950.00	\$1,535.00	\$1535.00+T&M	Road Salt-\$325.00/app
7		Rd. Walk(Slush)-\$125.00	Rd. Walk(Slush)-\$250.00	Rd. Walk(Slush)-\$250.00+T&M	Calcium-\$45.00/bag
8	Doylestown	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Langhorne	\$945.00	\$1,555.00	\$1555.00+T&M	Road Salt-\$300.00/app
10		Rd. Walk(Slush)-\$185.00	Rd. Walk(Slush)-\$370.00	Rd. Walk(Slush)-\$370.00+T&M	Calcium-\$45.00/bag
11	Levittown	\$710.00	\$1,170.00	\$1170.00+T&M	Road Salt-\$255.00/app
12		N/A	N/A	N/A	Calcium-\$45.00/bag
13	Perkasie	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Quakertown	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Yardley	\$710.00	\$1,135.00	\$1135.00+T&M	Road Salt-\$285.00/app
16		N/A	N/A	N/A	Calcium-\$45.00/bag
17					
18	T&M(Roads)	\$125.00/truck/hr.			
19	T&M(Walks)	\$55.00/man/hr.			

W.D.B. Lawn and Garden Services Inc. bid for  
Bucks County Free Library-Landscape and Snow Removal 2020-2021

**Bid Pricing:**

These prices are the charges to be billed to the Library. No additional fees, surcharges, costs or expenses will be billed or paid by BCFL. **Invoicing shall include the dates of actual service.**

MONTHLY LANDSCAPING BID SUBMISSION WORKSHEET

LOCATION	Landscaping Maintenance	Garden Maintenance	Total
BENSALEM	\$	NA	\$
DOYLESTOWN	\$ 10,185.00	Front Garden, Courtyard and Back Yard \$ 4,600.00	\$ 14,785.00
LANGHORNE	Include two meadow cuts \$	Courtyard \$	\$
LEVITTOWN	\$	Front Garden	\$
PERKASIE	\$ 3,710.00	Side Garden \$ 2,700.00	\$ 6,410.00
QUAKERTOWN	\$ 10,525.00	NA	\$ 10,525.00
YARDLEY	\$	NA	\$