

Fiber Locations	Transport	Current Bandwidth	Bandwidth Tier Bids Requested	Xtel Communications		Comcast Business Communications (WAN)		Comcast Business Communications Individual		Suneysys WAN	
				Total Recurring Cost Per Month	Buildout Cost	Total Recurring Cost Per Month	Buildout Cost	Total Recurring Cost Per Month	Buildout Cost	Total Recurring Cost Per Month	Buildout Cost
Bucks County Free Library System (6 Libraries)	Fiber	1 GB/s symmetrical	200Mbit/s	\$1234 x 6 = \$7404	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,063.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			400Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,603.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			600Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,046.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			800Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,398.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	2345 x 6 = \$14,070	\$0	\$7,484	\$0	\$2,500.00	\$0	\$5,700	\$0
Feasterville	Fiber	1 GB/s symmetrical	200Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,063.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			400Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,603.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			600Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,046.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			800Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,398.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	\$2,345.00	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	\$2,500.00	\$0	\$950	\$0
Northampton	Fiber	1 GB/s symmetrical	200Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,063.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			400Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,603.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			600Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,046.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			800Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,398.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	\$2,345.00	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	\$2,500.00	\$0	\$950	\$0
Southampton	Fiber	1 GB/s symmetrical	200Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,063.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			400Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,603.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			600Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,046.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			800Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,398.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	\$2,345.00	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	\$2,500.00	\$0	\$950	\$0
Warminster	Fiber	1 GB/s symmetrical	200Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,063.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			400Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$1,603.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			600Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,046.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			800Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$2,398.50	\$0	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	\$2,345.00	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	\$2,500.00	\$0	\$950	\$0
Fallsington	Comcast	15Mbit/s down, 3Mbit/s up	25 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$99.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			50 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$109.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			100 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$199.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			200 Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$349.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	No Bid	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,083	\$0
Morrisville	Verizon	25Mbit/s symmetrical	25 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$99.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			50 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$109.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			100 Mbit/s	\$995.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$199.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			200 Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$349.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	No Bid	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,083	\$0
New Hope	Comcast	150Mbit/s down, 10Mbit/s up	25 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$99.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			50 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$109.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			100 Mbit/s	\$995.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$199.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			200 Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$349.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	No Bid	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,083	\$0
Pipersville	Verizon	5Mbit/s down, 2Mbit/s up	25 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$99.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			50 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$109.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			100 Mbit/s	\$995.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$199.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			200 Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$349.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	No Bid	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,083	\$0
Riegelsville	RCN Cable	5Mbit/s down, 768kbit/s up	25 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$99.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			50 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$109.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			100 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$199.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			200 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$349.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	No Bid	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,083	\$0
Wrightstown	Comcast	75 Mbit/s down, 15 Mbit/s up	25 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$99.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			50 Mbit/s	No Bid	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$109.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			100 Mbit/s	\$995.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$199.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			200 Mbit/s	\$1,234.00	\$0	No Bid	\$0	\$349.95	\$49.00	No Bid	\$0
			1Gbit/s	No Bid	\$0	\$1,069	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,083	\$0
Internet for WAN				No Bid	No Bid	\$2,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,300	No Bid